Tuesday, March 05, 2019

Sheriff Uniforms, Equipment, & Fitting

RFP 2019-03

Fleet Safety Equipment
VENDOR INFORMATION

Signed Insurance Bid Security Check List Completed
Yes | Yes Yes | Yes
511 Brand: Equal Brand:
Pants | Shirts Jackets |
No Bid | No Bid No Bid | No Bid
Safariland: Equal Brand:
Body Armor Duty Belt Holster Cuff Case
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Magazine Holder Flashlight Holder Other: Other:
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Streamlight: Yes Equal Brand:
Flashlight |0ther: Other: |0ther:
$107.88 | |
Defense Tech: Yes Equal Brand:
3 oz Pepper Spray |0ther: Other: |0ther
$10.64 | |
Blackinton: Yes Equal Brand:
Badge | Nameplate Emblem |
$121.52 | $29.79 $2.80 |
Asp: Yes Equal Brand:
Baton: Other: Other: Other:
$79.47
Reference Auth. Uniform Experience Section 12 Brands Brands Separate List
Yes Yes Yes N/A
Fitting Room Needs Room Weekly Fitting # of Days for Fitting
N/A N/A N/A N/A
# of Day for Alterations Years Uniform Experience Total Days # of Employees
N/A N/A N/A 9
# for this RFP # of Years in Business 9 References # of Offices
N/A 39 No, 8 not in form 21
Location 1 Type of Organization Closest Location
1100 Hemlock St, N Little Rock, AR 72114 Professional Corp Little Rock
Galls, Inc
VENDOR INFORMATION
Signed Insurance Bid Security Check List Completed
Yes Yes Yes | Yes
511 Brand: Yes Equal Brand:

Mens Pants 74326

Womens Pants

$42.64 - Size 30-44

$48.44 Size 46-60

$42.64 Sixe 2-20

$48.44 Size 22-28

Shirts Mens 72345 Womens 62025 Jackets 48112
Sizes $42.64 XS-2X $48.44 3X-6X $218.56
Safariland: Yes Equal Brand:

Body Armor -SBA-M1-SBA-
SX02-1I-SBASTP-5X8

Duty Belts -94-XX-4 Price by size

$64.88 Size 22-46, $66.38 Size 48,

$70.88 Size 52, $72.38 Size

$73.88 size 56, $73.37 Size

T $69.38 Size 50 54, 58
Holster Cuff Case Magazine Holder Flashlight Holder
$145.80 $30.98 $30.45 $22.58
Belt Keeper 62-4-4HS Double Glove Pouch 33-3-4V Bianchi/Safariland Accumold Nylon Trouser Belt 17705
$19.43 $16.80 $22.58

Streamlight: Yes

Equal Brand:

Flashlight 75813

Other: Streamlight 69210 Gun Light w/ strobe function

$141.66

$135.03

Defense Tech: Yes

Equal Brand:

Deftech 1030672 - 3 oz
Pepper Spray

Safariland 38-4-48HS Mace Case

Safariland 38-48-HS MKIV Defense Spray Case

$15.22

$22.58

$22.58

Blackinton: Yes

Equal Brand:

Blackinton B953 HG W Full Color Seal Standard Size Badge

Size Nameplate

Blackinton A6041 Standard

Premier P600, P602, P604
Standard Brass Emblem

$79.99

$22.05

$6.99

Asp: Yes

Equal Brand:

Baton: Asp 52410

Asp 52433, 21in Rotating Sidebreak Scabbard

$99.00 $36.75
Reference Auth. Uniform Experience Section 12 Brands Brands Separate List
Yes Yes Yes No
Fitting Room Needs Room Weekly Fitting # of Days for Fitting
Yes No Yes Same day
# of Day for Alterations Years Uniform Experience Total Days # of Employees
1-90 Days 50+ 1-90 Days 4 in Springdale - 1700 total
# for this RFP # of Years in Business 9 References # of Offices
5 50 Yes 95+
Location 1 Location 2 Type of Organization Closest Location
Cruse Unlformsl 1048 5 48TH Cruse Uniforms 1201 Barrow Rd, .
St, Ste C,752p7r‘|5r:‘gdale AR Little Rock, AR 72205 LLC Springdale




