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Tuesday, February 11, 2025

SHERIFF FLEET
BID 2025-01

Superior Automotive Group
VENDOR INFORMATION

Total for 2 non-pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV:
Delivery Free to Cost:

B. Total for each non-pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV

A. Total for each Police Pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV:
Total for 15 Police Pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV:

Delivery Free to Cost:

$54,418.00 
$816,270.00 

$0.00 
$62,685.00

$0.00
$125,370.00

$52,650.00

Donohoo Chevrolet
VENDOR INFORMATION

A. Total for each Police Pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV: $52,685.00 

Delivery Free to Cost:
D. Total for 1 2025 Ford Transit Cargo Van:

Delivery Free to Cost:
$68,485.00

$0.00

C. Total for 1 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 4WD Crew Cab 147:

Total for 15 Police Pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV: $790,275.00 
Delivery Free to Cost: $9,750.00 

B. Total for each non-pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV
$122,690.00Total for 2 non-pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV:

Delivery Free to Cost: $1,300.00
C. Total for 1 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 4WD Crew Cab 147: $53,410.00

Delivery Free to Cost:
D. Total for 1 2025 Ford Transit Cargo Van: NO BID 

Delivery Free to Cost: NO BID 

Don Brown Chevrolet 
VENDOR INFORMATION

A. Total for each Police Pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV: $53,736.00 
Total for 15 Police Pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV: $806,040.00 

D. Total for 1 2025 Ford Transit Cargo Van: NO BID
Delivery Free to Cost: NO BID

$61,345.00

Delivery Free to Cost: $500.00 Each - $1,000 Total
C. Total for 1 Chevrolet Silverado 2500 4WD Crew Cab 147: $49,905.00

Delivery Free to Cost:

Delivery Free to Cost: $500.00 Each - $7500 Total
B. Total for each non-pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV $53,123.00

Total for 2 non-pursuit Chevrolet Tahoe 4WD SUV: $106,246.00
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